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LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF MANITOBA 

THE STANDING COMMITTEE ON PRIVILEGES AND ELECTIONS 

Thursday, 7 October, 1982 

Time - 10:00 a.m. 

CHAIRMAN - Mr. A. AnsteH 

MR. CHAIRMAN: We have a quorum. gentlemen. Our 
first item of business is to deal with the resignation 
which the Committee Clerk received from Mr. Ban man 
as a member of the Committee, dated August 26th. Mr. 
Banman's letter suggests that Mr. Nordman will be 
sitting on this Committee in his place, however, we 
need a motion to replace Mr. Banman. 

I'll entertain that motion, Mr. Sherman. 

MR. l. SHERMAN: I so move, Mr. Chairman, that Mr. 
Banman's letter of resignation be accepted and that 
Mr. Nordman be formally nominated to replace him on 
the Committee. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Is that agreed? (Agreed) Mr. 
Nordman, welcome to the Committee again. 

The Clerk had circulated to all members of the 
Committee copies of all letters of application. Before 
we proceed to involve ourselves in any detailed dis­
cussion, there are two items. I believe, we should 
consider. 

During consideration of a personnel appointment 
last spring we passed motions to meet in camera once 
we commenced examination of resumes and discus­
sions of individuals. Is that your will and pleasure for 
this appointment as well? 

MR. l. SHERMAN: Agreed. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: Could I have a motion to that effect 
please? 

MR. P. FOX: So moved, Mr. Chairman. 

MR. CHAIRMAN: lt is moved by Mr. Fox that we meet 
in camera. Is it agreed? Agreed and so ordered. 

The meetings of the Committee for the balance of 
today and further discussions on this subject will be 
held in camera. 
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